
Theme Note: 
We all think!  
Everyone thinks!  
Thinking is spontaneous to 

us. Among those thoughts 
some are biased, distorted; 

some are entangled with 
prejudices; some are 
conscious; some are 

unconscious and so on and 
so forth. We are weaving 
our life with all sorts of 

thoughts. The quality of our 
thought determines the 

quality of our life in several 
significant ways. In that 
sense, our thoughts shape 

our life. Moreover, critical 
thinking unfolds new 
avenues for our thought. 

Thus we need to be critical 
in our thought and about 

our thoughts. Delving deep 
into the nitty-gritties of this 
issue will take us to the 

philosophical perplexities 
regarding critical thinking. 

So Let Us Get Critical! 
 
Kindly join us with the 

following Registration 
link: 
https://forms.gle/xv7Gkni

8DXjLmXo5A   
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TWO DAYS NATIONAL 
WEBINAR ON  

 

"LET US GET CRITICAL: 
PHILOSOPHICAL 

REFLECTIONS ON 
CRITICAL THINKING" 
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Speakers  

Day 1: 24th March, 2021 
 

  
 

Professor Madhucchanda Sen, 

Department of Philosophy,  
Jadavpur University, 

Kolkata, West Bengal, India 
 
 

 
 

Professor Dipayan Pattanayak, 

Department of Philosophy,  
Jadavpur University, 

Kolkata, West Bengal, India 
 

 
 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Speakers 

Day 2: 25th March, 2021 
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Honourable Vice-Chancellor, 

Kazi-Nazrul University, 
Asansol, West Bengal, India 
 
 
 

 
 

Dr. Patitpaban Das 

Assistant Professor, 
Dept. of Philosophy 

Ravenshaw University 
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